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In fact, Africa is the only major geographical region where population is estimated to 
continue growing beyond 2100. By then, Africa’s share of global population will increase 
from the current 12% to about a third.  
 
Africa remains the region with the lowest level of contraceptive use (29% versus the global 
average of 69%) and high demand for children (Population reference Bureau, 2011). 
Population growth and size have traditionally been sensitive and contentious issues among 
post-independence African leaders. During the 1970s and 1980s, African leaders perceived 
family planning, which was largely introduced and financed by Western countries, as an 
attempt to limit the number of Africans in the global population. At the 1974 Bucharest 
Population Conference, African policymakers joined their Southern Asia counterparts in 
rejecting calls for promotion of family planning to slow down population growth. Ten years 
later at the 1984 International Conference on Population in Mexico, African leaders 
maintained their views that population growth was not the major driver of 
underdevelopment. Apart from the suspicions that the African leaders had about the 
intentions of the Western development partners and experts, they believed they were 
protecting the reproductive aspirations of their constituents, who desired to have many 
children. Their position was bolstered by the surprising position adopted by the Reagan 
administration of the USA, who pushed the Mexico conference to adopt the position that 
population growth is not a major ingredient of development.  
 
At the 1994 International Conference on Population and Development (ICPD), position 
papers from most African countries acknowledged that rapid population growth was 
detrimental to their development efforts. However, the conference marked a major 
ideological shift from focusing on addressing rapid population growth and meeting 
demographic targets to a new paradigm aimed at meeting the socioeconomic and 
reproductive health needs of individual women and men. The new approach highlighted the 
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high fertility, Africa continues to harbour serious health challenges that have a direct effect 
on socio-economic development. The continent has the highest maternal mortality rates. 
For instance, the 2008 estimates of the maternal mortality ratio (MMR) were 260 for the 
World, 290 for developing regions, 280 for South Asia, 590 for Africa, and 640 for Sub-
Saharan Africa (WHO et al., 2010). The 2010 estimates of the proportion of married women 
using modern contraception followed the same trend: 55% globally, 44% for all developing 
countries (excluding China), 45% for South/Central Asia, 23% for Africa, and 17% for Sub-
Saharan Africa (Population Reference Bureau, 2010). Yet, family planning has the potential 
to not only he
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late 1960s through the early 1980s; a genocide in Rwanda which claimed nearly one million 
of its population, presenting a challenge of how to frame the benefits of FP in the aftermath; 
and decades of ethnic wars, famines and droughts in Ethiopia which consumed political 
support and resources away from health priorities in general, including FP. Furthermore, 
these challenges are notwithstanding the cultural and religious barriers, in favor of large 
families, that continue to exist in the three countries as they do in most Sub-Saharan 
countries. 
 
However, in the last decade or so, these three countries have overcome some of their 
challenges and experienced dramatic increases in contraceptive use with Rwanda registering 
the fastest rate of increase in contraceptive use in Sub-Saharan Africa at 4.0 percentage 
points per year! In addition, an analysis of trends in contraceptive method mix in all three 
countries shows 
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Table 1. Key Informant Interviews by Group 
 

 Rwanda  Malawi  Ethiopia  

FP TWG focus group discussion  1 - - 

Key informant interviews    
Government – policymakers 11 9 10 

Government – service providers 3 1 - 
Development partners 3 3 5 

International NGOs/private implementers 4 7 11 
Local NGOs/civil society 1 1 2 

Faith-based organizations / religious leaders  1 3 2 
Academic institution - 1 - 

Total  23 25 30 
 
Information garnered through the desk reviews and key informant interviews were 
synthesized to identify the factors that drove increases in contraceptive use in the 3 
successful case study countries (Rwanda, Malawi and Ethiopia), the challenges experienced, 
how they were addressed and what measures are being implemented or planned, to ensure 
sustainability of the recorded progress. The key factors that propelled the phenomenal 
increases in use of FP in the three countries were: 
 

• Political will and government commitment demonstrated by clear policies and 
implementation strategies; 

• Sustained funding of FP and RH services;  
• Strong healthcare infrastructure and system focusing on enhancing equitable access 

to quality services through task-shifting, improved referral system, well-trained 
health workers, and pro-poor health policies (including lost cost or free FP and other 
RH services); 

• Strong community outreach activities focused on getting services closer to isolated, 
vulnerable and marginalized communities;  

• Strong IEC programs to promote family planning and use of contraceptives, including 
promoting male involvement in RH and FP; and 

• Strengthening public-private partnerships in provision of FP and other RH services. 
 
This paper focuses on the origin, architecture and role of political will in facilitating the 
changes in the other factors and, ultimately, in increasing contraceptive use in the three case 
study countries. 
 
Results 
 
Table 2 shows trends in population, annual population growth rates, fertility rate, 
contraceptive use, and unmet need for family planning for the three countries between 
approximately 1990 and 2010.  
 
 
 



http://data.worldbank.org/data-catalog/world-development-indicators?cid=GPD_WDI
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trend is evidently aligned to the reorientation of the FP program in 1992 from a child spacing 
program to one focusing on family welfare. This upward trend continued to a CPR of 42.2% 
in 2010. However, Malawi’s fertility remained persistently high (about 6 children per woman 
in 2010). The most popular FP method is long-term (25.8%; or 61.1% of all modern 
methods). Of note, unmet need for FP has not change much in the past decade averaging at 
1 in 4 women (26.1%) having unmet need for FP. Of concern, the UN population projections 
show that Malawi’s population will more than triple to 49.7 million by 2050, if the current 
fertility rate is maintained, thereby augmenting Malawi’s already present development 
challenges. 
 
Ethiopia has the second largest population size in Sub-Saharan Africa after Nigeria. Its 
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Intensive advocacy by local and international experts and champions was essential for 
national adoption and sustainability of the FP agenda in the three case study countries. 
Local advocates led domestic advocacy efforts for the adoption of population policies while 
international advocates provided financial and technical support for initiating and sustaining 
domestic advocacy efforts and continue to play this role. In all three countries, local FP 
advocates include FP experts or champions in government like the Ministers of Health and 
non-government organizations, mainly comprising International Planned Parenthood 
Federation (IPPF) affiliates. In the case of Rwanda, the head of state, President Paul Kagame 
2000- present, emerged as a key local advocate. A key characteristic of local advocates is 
their grasp of the importance of FP, their ability to convince political elites and top level 
leadership about the importance of FP, and galvanize commitment and support for FP at all 
levels of leadership. 

In Rwanda, Dr. Jean Damascene Ntawukuriryayo, former Minister of Health and current 
president of the Senate, emerged as an early key local advocate at the center of domestic 
advocacy efforts. 
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Malawi started as a child spacing program after President Banda was convinced that 
modern contraceptives could be used to reinforce traditional child spacing to save the lives 
of mothers who were dying from having children too close together. This continues to be a 
big selling point for FP in Malawi, as well as Rwanda, Ethiopia and the rest of Sub-Saharan 
Africa. 

The role of population in undermining efforts to sustainably improve 
economic performance and alleviate poverty 

The economic turbulence that most of these countries have experienced since the 1980s 
has also made it clear that it will be difficult or impossible to break their development 
shackles without slowing rapid population growth. For instance, although some countries 
are meeting Millennium Development Goal number one, – to halve the percentage of 
people living in poverty between 1990 and 2015 –more Africans are living in extreme 
poverty today than in 1990 as a result of rapid population growth. Additionally, agricultural 
land size is decreasing, perpetuating food insecurity and rising unemployment lends itself to 
political instability, war and conflict. There is also stagnation of school outcomes leading to 
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an FP revolution in Africa, resulting in prioritization and increase of resources towards FP. 
Majority of African governments are beginning to recognize the adverse effects of rapid 
population growth and are keen to put in place measures to slow down the effects, as well 
as embracing family planning as one of the key interventions. In addition, there are different 
reasons for how political will for FP was generated and different ways in which political will 
manifests and affects FP policies and programs. Relatedly, political, economic and cultural 
circumstances of countries play a major role in how FP was and is perceived, how political 
will was generated, how it was manifested and the resulting design of FP policies and 
programs. Furthermore, political will works collectively with a number of other factors to 
contribute to 
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